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Sean McGee, an agent for the CIA, is on a routine drug trafficking case in Guatemala when his wife is
kidnapped in an attempt to stop him. It has the opposite effect. McGee follows a trail of corruption leading
him back to the USA. The much sought after criminal, El Tiburon (The Shark), is watching from the
shadows. He has been controlling the drug borders of the USA from the inside. He is untouchable, until now.
Suddenly exposed, El Tiburon fights back. But McGee and his own team of local indigenous Guatemalans
and military-trained Americans refuse to back down. The tension mounts as the victims of generations of
suppression join in the battle that will risk lives. McGee will rescue his wife no matter the stakes, but will
this be his final fight?
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From reader reviews:

Michael Riddle:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you
can add your knowledge by the reserve entitled El Tiburon. Try to make book El Tiburon as your close
friend. It means that it can to become your friend when you feel alone and beside that course make you
smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you a lot more
confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , let me make new experience in addition to
knowledge with this book.

Donna Jost:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time
to take a go walking, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or even read a book eligible
El Tiburon? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time with the
favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you have other opinion?

Maryann Goldberg:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, short story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not hoping El Tiburon that give your
satisfaction preference will be satisfied by simply reading this book. Reading addiction all over the world can
be said as the method for people to know world much better then how they react toward the world. It can't be
explained constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky man or woman but for all of you who wants to
be success person. So , for all of you who want to start looking at as your good habit, you can pick El
Tiburon become your personal starter.

Geraldine Matson:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is written or printed or illustrated from each source that filled update of news. On
this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media social
like newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You can add
your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just seeking
the El Tiburon when you needed it?
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